
       Knollwood C. C. Recap: September 6, 2017 

The MSGA’s ninth tournament of the 2017 season was held at Knollwood (East) C. C. in 
Granger, IN on September 6th.   This was the seventh MSGA tournament played at Knollwood 
over the years and the staff did a very nice job with lunch and the course.    
 
The turnout was a little less than expected with 87 players entered.  
 
The day’s weather was not a good day for golf with cool temperatures in the low 60’s and 
intermittent rain and drizzle mixed with sunshine and clouds.  As for the golf course, it was in 
nice condition for a late summer date.  The fairways were in perfect condition providing lots of 
perfect lies.  The rough was very thick and sometimes difficult for those who ventured there.  
Several of the large greens provided for long tough putts.  Overall, the course played very fair 
for the players as demonstrated by the many good scores.  With the rain, four players did not 
finish and did not post scores. 

Overall with handicaps, 27 players bested par of 72 while ten others matched par.  For the 83 
players who finished, the average Gross score was 90.0 with 73.7 as the average Net score, 1.7 
shots over par.  

In the Individual Medal competition, Stu Holaway lead the field with a three over par 75 (round 
included three bogeys and 15 pars) followed closely by Tom Knoll with 76 and Tom Smith and 
Tony Fallucca with 77’s.  Six others shot scores in the 70’s.   
 
In the Net competition, Peter MacEntee was the winner with a ten under par net 62 for the 
overall low-net for Flights A-D.  Next in line was Gary Drutis with a net 63 followed by Lee 
Burdorf with a net 65 and Bob Dunn with a 67.  Ten others shot net 68 or 69. 
 
The low-net winner in Flight E (played from the forward tees) was John Behee with a net 62 
followed by Bruce Wargo with 67.  Eleven players played in Flight E (players whose age plus 
handicap equals 95). 
 
In the Skins competition, Bruce Wargo was the only multiple winner with two skins.  In total, 
there were 21 skins in the five flights.   
 
In the Closest-to-the-Pin contest, the best of the day was Robert Woolever’s shot that stopped 
one foot two inches away on the 141-yard Hole #14.   
                
Congratulations to award winners in all the flights.  The complete list of winners can be found 
on the Tournament Results tab.   



 
In the season long Brady Cup competition, Stu Holaway holds the lead with 1355 points 
followed by Bob Dunn (1305) and Abe Ismail with (1265).  Roy Shepard and Dave Dunn hold the 
fourth and fifth positions with one event left on the schedule.  The Top-25 standings are shown 
on the Brady Cup tab. 
 
 
 
 


